3 ER - Tuesday- April 29th, 2025
ril ALLEY lllinois Closing Grain Bids- North

COOPERATIVE

Bradford Cambridge Man/Sheff/Min/DG Galva Altona IL River BioUrja - Peoria  Big River Resources- Galva Miss River Mendota Rail
Apr 21-30 444.0 431.0 440.0 4405 | 435.0 | 464.0 | 3.5 K 0.0 [Closed| K 462.5| 2.0 K 455.0 | -1 K 440.5 -200| K 455.5 -5.0 K] 4505 |-10.0 K
May 1-10 445.0 435.0 441.0 4445 | 436.0 | 465.0 | 4.5 K 455.0 | -15.0 K 464.5| 4.0 K 460.0 | -10.0 K 4445 -16.0| K 455.5 -5.0 K] 4505 |-10.0 K
May 11-20 445.0 435.0 441.0 4445 | 436.0 | 465.0 | 4.5 K 455.0 | -15.0 K 464.5| 4.0 K 460.0 | -10.0 K 4445 -16.0| K 455.5 -5.0 K] 4505 |-10.0 K
May 21-31 445.0 437.0 441.0 446.5 | 436.0 | 465.0 | 4.5 K 457.0 | -13.0 K 464.5| 4.0 K 460.0 | -10.0 K 446.5 -140| K 455.5 -5.0 K] 4505 |-10.0 K
June 25 449.0 438.0 445.0 451.0 | 441.0 | 469.0 | -1.0 N 458.0 | -12.0 N 468.0| -2.0 N 470.0| 0.0 N 456.0 -140| N 462.0 -8.0 N] 4550 |-15.0N
July 25 451.0 440.0 447.0 453.0 | 443.0 | 471.0 | 1.0 N 460.0 | -10.0 N 470.0| 0.0 N 473.0| 3.0 N 458.0 -120| N 462.0 -8.0 N] 4580 |-12.0/N
Aug 25 405.0 405.0 407.0 395.0 | 403.0 | 425.0 | -10.0 U 425.0 | -10.0 U 425.0| -10.0 U 0.0 |nobid| U 400.0 -350| U 409.0 -26.0 U] 405.0 |-30.0/ U
Oct 25 401.5 401.5 409.5 4125 | 4025 | 4145 | -30.0 4 4145 | -30.0 4 414.5| -30.0 4 0.0 |nobid| Z 412.5 -320| Z 4135 -31.0 Z| 4145 |-30.0Z
Dec 25 419.5 410.5 4155 4215 | 4115 ] 4395 | -5.0 4 430.5 | -14.0 4 4375| -7.0 4 0.0 |nobid| Z 426.5 -180| Z 423.5 -21.0 Z| 4295 |-15.0|Z
Jan 26 427.5 414.5 423.5 4275 | 4185 | 4475 | -12.0 H 434.5 | -25.0 H 4475 -12.0 H 0.0 inobid H 432.5 270 H 0.0 closed H] 4445 |-15.0 H
SOYBEANS Corn ADM Hennepin 7-4cb
Bradford ambriage a D effield alva Altona AD Rive B Rive arg Rive Alto-Pe AD 0] ADM Lacon 7-4chb
ADM Spring Valley 7-4 cb)
Apr 21-30 1020.0 | 1007.0 1017.0 1011.0] 1011.0] 1041.0f 0.0 K 1041.0| 0.0 K ]1041.0] 0.0 K [ 452.0]-18.0 K 470.0{ 0.0 K ADM Clinton 7-4 c b|
May 1-10 1022.0| 1009.0 1019.0 1013.0] 1013.0] 1043.0| 2.0 K 1043.0f 2.0 K ]1043.0] 2.0 K [ 455.0|-15.0 K 465.0{ -5.0 K ADM Mendota Rail 7-3 c only]
May 11-20 1022.0| 1009.0 1019.0 1013.0] 1013.0] 1043.0f 2.0 K 1043.0f 2.0 K ]1043.0] 2.0 K | 455.0|-15.0 K 461.0{ -9.0 K BioUrja Peoria 6-4 c only|]
May 21-31 1022.0| 1009.0 1019.0 1013.0] 1013.0] 1043.0f 2.0 K 1043.0f 2.0 K ]1043.0] 2.0 K [ 455.0|-15.0 K 461.0{ -9.0 K Alto-Pekin 6-4 c only|
June 25 1028.0| 1015.0 1025.0 1019.0 ] 1019.0] 1049.0| -4.0 N 1049.0| -4.0 N ]1048.0| -5.0 N ]| 4700 0.0 N 461.0{ -9.0 N CHS - Davenport 6-3cb
July 25 1032.0| 1019.0 1029.0 1023.0 ] 1023.0] 1053.0f 0.0 N 1053.0f 0.0 N [1051.0] -2.0 N 4730 3.0 N 461.0{ -9.0 N CHS - Annawan Closed|
Aug 25 1005.0| 993.0 1001.0 995.0 | 993.0 | 1023.0| -23.0 Q 1026.0| -20.0 Q [1023.0| -23.0 Q 0.0 |no bid [§] 415.0{ -20.0 U Cargill Lacon 7-3 c b|
Oct 25 974.0 961.0 970.0 985.0 | 964.0 | 960.0 | 985.0 | -40.0 X 990.0 | -35.0 X 985.0 | -40.0 X 0.0 |no bid z 424.5{ -20.0 z Cargill Spring Valley 7-3 c b|
Dec 25 1004.0 991.0 1000.0 994.0 | 990.0 | 1017.0| -20.0 F 1025.0| -12.0 F 1017.0 | -20.0 F 0.0 |no bid z 424.5¢ -20.0 z Big River Resources Closed|
Jan 26 1011.0] 998.0 1008.0 1002.0 ] 1002.0] 1032.0/ -5.0 F 1031.0] -6.0 F 1032.0| -5.0 F 0.0 |no bid H 439.5i -20.0 H Marquis Energy 4-8 ¢ only|
CGB Hennepin 74cb
Corn Beans Wheat Office [ Cell/Daytime CGB Utica 7-4 cb
Jan-00 0 Bradford: 309.897.7491 Sam Bair 309.883.3158
Jan-00 0|May-25 1041 Angie Wall 309.897.7491
May-25 460.5(Jul-25 1053 Cambridge: 309.937.2435 Sara Yerkey 309.937.2435
Jul-25 470)|Aug-25 1046 Galva: 309.932.2081 Cody Forde 309.714.9286 River Valley Cooperative will not accept unnapproved
Sep-25 435[Nov-25 1025 Manlius: 815.445.2311 Marcia Hix 815.445.2311 grain varieties containing transgenic events that are not
Dec-25 444.5|Jan-26 1037] 24-May 506 Dean Sweenie 815.303.9301 approved by our major export markets including China,
Mar-26 459.5|Mar-26 1041| 25-Jul| 525.5 Michelle Cooney 815.876.6451 Japan, South Korea, Canada, the European Union, and
Jan-00 0.00 Mexico.
Jan-00 0.00 [May-25 -11-0
May-25 -15-0 [Jul-25 -9-6
Jul-25 -13-0 [Aug-25 -8-2
Sep-25 -6-6  [Nov-25 -9-4
Dec-25 -5-6 [Jan-26 -9-6
Mar-26 -5-4 [Mar-26 -9-4




